

AGGREGATES

BID DATE: 12/13/2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2019 – 12/31/2019

BIDDERS	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX	PLANT LOCATION
Belangers Gravel & Stone Inc.	10184 State Rte. 21 S., Wayland, NY 14572	(585) 728-3906 (585) 728-9595	10184 State Rte. 21 S., Wayland, New York
Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co., Inc.	2105 S. Broadway, Pine City, NY 14871	(607) 737-6200 (607) 767-0841	Coopers Plains, New York
Dolomite Products Company, Inc. (dba A.L. BLADES)	7610 County Route 65, Hornell, NY 14843	(607) 324-3636 (607) 324-0998	Bath Quarry, 6185 Turnpike Road, Bath, NY 14810
Dolomite Products Company, Inc. (dba A.L. BLADES)	7610 County Route 65, Hornell, NY 14843	(607) 324-3636 (607) 324-0998	Howard Sand & Gravel, 3801 Mill Road, Avoca, NY 14809
Dolomite Products Company Inc. dba A.L. Blades	1150 Penfield Road, Rochester, NY 14627	(585) 739-2048 (585) 924-7753	Manchester-1719 Lovers Lane, Clifton Springs, NY 14432
Green Dream International LLC	2331 Mill Road, Suite 100, Alexandria, VA 22314	(202) 470-4600 (202) 204-8444	Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting, 127 Chemung Flats Road, Chemung, NY 14825
Hanson Aggregates New York, LLC	6895 Ellicott Street, Pavilion, NY 14525	(585) 584-3132 (585) 584-8743	Oaks Corners, New York Honeoye Falls, New York
New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co. Inc.	500 Como Park Blvd., Buffalo, NY 14227	(716) 826-7310 (716) 826-1342	8615 Wehrle Drive, Williamsville, NY & Alfred Station, NY
Seneca Stone Corporation	2105 S. Broadway, Pine City, New York 14871	(607) 737-6200 (607) 737-1056	2747 Canoga Rd., Seneca Falls, New York
Spallina Materials Inc.	1 Conlon Ave, PO Box 337, Mount Morris, NY 14510	(585) 658-2248 (585) 658-4054	822 Jones Road, Cohocton, NY
Syracuse Sand & Gravel	PO Box 6418, Syracuse, NY 13217	(315) 433-5115 (315) 433-1920	7038-7098 Moore Road, Bath, NY

**AGGREGATES; FOB PLANT SITE
QUARRY STONE
(\$ / TON)**

BID DATE: 12/13/2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2019 – 12/31/2019

Awardee to furnish and load aggregates onto County trucks at awardee's plant site.

	Dolomite#1	Dolomite #3	Hanson	New Enterprise	Seneca Stone	Syracuse
PENN DOT #1B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
NYS DOT #1A	NO BID	\$ 16.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.45	\$ 15.00	NO BID
NYS DOT #1ST	NO BID	\$ 15.00	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 14.50	NO BID
NYS DOT #1	\$ 12.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 16.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 14.50	NO BID
NYS DOT #2	\$ 12.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 16.00	\$ 15.65	\$ 14.25	NO BID
NYS DOT #3	\$ 12.50	\$ 14.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 14.25	NO BID
NYS DOT Subbase Type 3	NO BID	\$ 10.25	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 9.00	NO BID
NYS DOT Subbase Type 4	NO BID	\$ 10.25	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 9.00	NO BID
Gabion Stone	\$ 23.00	\$ 15.25	\$ 18.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	NO BID
Miscellaneous	\$ 9.25	\$ 16.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.50	\$ 6.95
PLANT LOCATION:	Bath, NY	Clifton Springs, NY	Honeoye Falls & Oaks Corners, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station NY	Seneca Falls NY	Bath NY

This page **award to all bidders**. Purchase based on low total cost including County trucking cost.

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 1/07/19

**AGGREGATES; FOB PLANT SITE
CRUSHED GRAVEL
(\$ / TON)**

BID DATE: 12/13/2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2019 – 12/31/2019

Awardee to furnish and load aggregates onto County trucks at awardee's plant site.

	Belangers	Dalrymple	Dolomite #2	New Enterprise	Spallina	Syracuse
PENN DOT #1B	NO BID	\$16.00	NO BID	\$14.10	NO BID	NO BID
NYS DOT #1A	NO BID	\$17.00	\$18.00	\$14.10	\$13.65	NO BID
NYS DOT #1ST	NO BID	\$15.25	\$16.50	\$13.35	\$12.95	NO BID
NYS DOT #1	NO BID	\$15.00	\$16.50	\$13.35	\$12.65	NO BID
NYS DOT #2	NO BID	\$15.00	\$16.50	\$ 12.80	\$12.40	NO BID
NYS DOT #3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
NYS DOT Subbase Type 3	\$6.50	\$10.75	\$8.75	NO BID	\$7.50	NO BID
NYS DOT Subbase Type 4	\$6.50	\$10.75	\$8.75	\$ 7.70	\$7.50	\$9.95
Gabion Stone	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Miscellaneous	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
PLANT LOCATION:	Wayland, NY	Coopers Plains, NY	Howard, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station, NY	Cohocton NY	Bath, NY

This page **award to all bidders**. Purchase based on low total cost including County trucking cost.

AGGREGATES
(\$ / TON)

BID DATE: 12/13/2018
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2019 – 12/31/2019

QUADRANT 1

Awardee to furnish and deliver aggregates to any site located within Quadrant 1 as specified by the County.
Quadrant One is comprised of the following towns: Addison, Campbell, Caton, Corning, Erwin, Hornby, Lindley, Rathbone, Thurston & Tuscarora.

	Dalrymple	Dolomite #2	Green Dream	New Enterprise	Seneca Stone	Spallina	Syracuse
NYSDOT Subbase Type 4; Crushed	\$15.50	\$21.25	\$ 19.93	\$18.75	\$ 17.00	\$16.95	\$17.95
Plant Location:	Coopers Plains, NY	Howard, NY	Chemung, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station, NY	Seneca Falls NY	Cohocton NY	Bath, NY

QUADRANT 2

Awardee to furnish and deliver aggregates to any site located within Quadrant 2; as specified by the County.
Quadrant Two is comprised of the following towns: Cameron, Canisteo, Greenwood, Hartsville, Jasper, Troupsburg, West Union and Woodhull.

	Dolomite #2	Green Dream	New Enterprise	Seneca Stone	Spallina	Syracuse
NYSDOT Subbase Type 4; Crushed	\$17.25	\$ 21.22	\$14.25	\$ 18.00	\$16.30	\$16.45
Plant Location:	Howard, NY	Chemung, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station, NY	Seneca Falls NY	Cohocton NY	Bath, NY

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 1/07/19 AS SHADED

AGGREGATES (\$ / TON)

BID DATE: 12/13/2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2019 – 12/31/2019

QUADRANT 3

Awardee to furnish and deliver aggregates to any site located within Quadrant 3; as specified by the County.

Quadrant Three is comprised of the following towns: Avoca, Cohocton, Dansville, Fremont, Hornellsville, Howard and Wayland.

	Dolomite #2	Green Dream	New Enterprise	Seneca Stone	Spallina	Syracuse
NYS DOT Subbase Type 4; Crushed	\$ 17.25	\$ 21.22	\$18.00	\$ 18.00	\$15.25	\$16.45
Plant Location:	Howard, NY	Chemung, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station, NY	Seneca Falls NY	Cohocton NY	Bath, NY

QUADRANT 4

Awardee to furnish and deliver aggregates to any site located within Quadrant 4; as specified by the County.

Quadrant Four is comprised of the following towns: Bath, Bradford, Prattsburgh, Pulteney, Urbana, Wayne and Wheeler.

	Dalrymple	Dolomite #2	Green Dream	New Enterprise	Seneca Stone	Spallina	Syracuse
NYS DOT Subbase Type 4; Crushed	\$16.50	\$ 18.75	\$ 20.36	\$17.95	\$ 18.00	\$15.95	\$14.95
Plant Location:	Coopers Plains, NY	Howard, NY	Chemung, NY	Williamsville & Alfred Station, NY	Seneca Falls NY	Cohocton NY	Bath, NY

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 1/07/19 AS SHADED