

READY MIX CONCRETE

BID DATE: 1/30/2020

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/3/2020 – 12/31/2020

Hanson Aggregates New York, LLC, 6895 Ellicott St., Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 584-8743
 Spallina Materials, Inc., 1 Conlon Ave., PO Box 337, Mt. Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054
 Custom-Mix Concrete, Inc., 1229 Lowman Road, Lowman, NY 14861 (607) 737-0281 / (607) 737-0349

QUADRANT 1			
	CUSTOM-MIX	HANSON	SPALLINA
NYSDOT Class A for Structures	\$ 142.00 / cy	\$ 148.50 / cy	NO BID
NYSDOT Class H for Structures	\$ 144.00 / cy	\$ 152.00 / cy	NO BID
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM)	\$ 120.00 / cy	\$ 130.00 / cy	NO BID
Addison, Campbell, Caton, Corning, Erwin, Hornby, Lindley, Rathbone, Thurston & Tuscarora			

QUADRANT 2			
	CUSTOM-MIX	HANSON	SPALLINA
NYSDOT Class A for Structures	\$ 144.00 / cy	\$ 150.00 / cy	NO BID
NYSDOT Class H for Structures	\$ 146.00 / cy	\$ 154.00 / cy	NO BID
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM)	\$ 122.00 / cy	\$ 130.00 / cy	NO BID
Cameron, Canisteo, Greenwood, Hartsville, Jasper, Troupsburg, West Union & Woodhull			

MULTIPLE AWARD based on low bid, contingent on awardee's ability to batch, deliver and discharge within specified time limitations.

READY MIX CONCRETE

BID DATE: 1/30/2020

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2/3/2020 – 12/31/2020

QUADRANT 3			
	CUSTOM-MIX	HANSON	SPALLINA
NYSDOT Class A for Structures	NO BID	\$ 140.00 / cy	\$ 136.00 / cy
NYSDOT Class H for Structures	NO BID	\$ 143.00 / cy	\$ 140.00 / cy
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM)	NO BID	\$ 115.00 / cy	\$ 110.00 / cy
Avoca, Cohocton, Dansville, Fremont, Hornellsville, Howard & Wayland			

QUADRANT 4			
	CUSTOM-MIX	HANSON	SPALLINA
NYSDOT Class A for Structures	\$ 144.00 / cy	\$ 145.00 / cy	\$ 141.00 / cy
NYSDOT Class H for Structures	\$ 146.00 / cy	\$ 147.00 / cy	\$ 145.00 / cy
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM)	\$ 122.00 / cy	\$ 125.00 / cy	\$ 121.00 / cy
Bath, Bradford, Prattsburgh, Pulteney, Urbana, Wayne & Wheeler			

MULTIPLE AWARD based on low bid, contingent on awardee's ability to batch, deliver and discharge within specified time limitations.